6/24/2019 Mail - Elsinger, Jason - Outlook

Fwd: Travel Grant Request

Anthony Stefan <anthonydeanstefan@gmail.com>
Tue 11/27/2018 4:45 AM
To: Elsinger, Jason <jelsinger@flsouthern.edu>

Dr. Elsinger,

Here is the information from Alie about funding.
See you later today,

Anthony

—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: Alie Brewer <breweralie@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 11:33 AM
Subject: Re: Travel Grant Request

To: <anthonydeanstefan@gmail.com>

Hello Anthony,

| have brought this up to the Math Club Executive Board and since there are at least two other
conferences that students are looking to attend, each student can only receive $100 per
conference. That is, we can only grant you $300 as of right now. However, if we have any money
left over in the budget at the end of the year, we would be happy to reimburse you.

Please consider the $300 a reimbursement for registration fees and any travel costs. This means
that you can only receive the money after the conference is over with receipts to account for the
$300. Please note that this money cannot be used to cover the cost of food or drink, as per SGA
guidelines.

| also wanted to let you know that for JMM there is a significant cost reduction for the registration if
you are a member of MAA or KME!

Best regards,
Alie Brewer

On Wed, Nov 14, 2018 at 6:27 PM Anthony Stefan <anthonydeanstefan@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Alie,
Thank you for taking the time to discuss my request for SGA funding with the Math Club
executive board. | understand that the limit is $800 a year, and appreciate anything we can
receive. | have discussed the budget with Max Giard, and | am asking the Math Club to request at
least $400 from SGA for our travel costs. Attached is a copy of our abstract for the talk at the
JMM event.

Thank you,
Anthony D. Stefan
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